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Hospital Course

Myocardial infarctions due to left circumflex artery (LCX) 
occlusions are under-diagnosed and mismanaged. We 
describe a case of an occult total occlusion of the LCX 
artery that presented with atypical symptoms, which then 
degenerated into convulsive syncope, polymorphic 
ventricular tachycardia and cardiac arrest, before being 
taken for emergent coronary angiography.  

Leading organizations have published clinical practice 
guidelines for ST-elevation myocardial infarctions (STEMI) 
and out-of-hospital cardiac arrest; however, guidelines for 
non-STEMI, cardiac arrest in the emergency department 
(ED), and convulsive syncope are less defined. 

A middle-aged, African-American woman was brought to 
our ED after calling 911 for feeling weak and dizzy. On 
arrival, the patient was afebrile, had a blood pressure of 
154/78 mmHg, a heart rate of 56 beats/min, and oxygen 
saturation of 100% on room air. She was mildly confused 
and unable to give a reliable history. She had repeated 
episodes of vomiting. Physical examination was otherwise 
normal.

We believe that our case presents diagnostic dilemmas 
in diagnosing LCX MIs and highlights the need for fresh 
guidelines for proceeding with emergent coronary 
angiography in non ST-elevation MIs. 

MIs due to LCX artery occlusions may present with atypical 
symptoms and ECGs without ST-elevations. The standard 
12-lead ECG lacks sensitivity in detecting ischemia of the 
lateral and posterior walls. Performing a “posterior ECG” 
may be useful. Acute complications are common. Global 
cerebral hypoxia induced by occult cardiac arrhythmias 
may present as convulsive syncope and is treated with 
anti-arrhythmic medications and not anti-epileptic. Occult 
polymorphic ventricular tachycardia may occur and 
decompensate into sudden cardiac arrest. Favorable 
resuscitation features (witnessed arrest, initial VF/VT 
rhythm, less than 30 minutes to ROSC amongst others) 
should be utilized to advocate for emergent coronary 
angiography, which could be lifesaving.

The initial ECG revealed new ST-segment depressions and 
T-wave inversions in the lateral leads. Shortly after arrival, 
she had a brief seizure-like episode after which she had a 
cardiac arrest. She was appropriately resuscitated. She 
was taken for immediate coronary angiography which 
revealed a 100% thrombotic occlusion of the proximal LCX 
artery with a TIMI 0 flow. Aspiration thrombectomy was 
performed with placement of one drug eluting stent. The 
patient was discharged in stable condition.

Take Home Messages
• MIs due to LCX artery occlusions do not always present 

with classic symptoms and ECGs.
• For patients with a high clinical suspicion of coronary 

artery occlusion, a low threshold for emergent coronary 
angiography should be maintained.

• Favorable resuscitation features should be utilized to 
advocate for immediate coronary angiography in cardiac 
arrest patients. 

Image 1: EKG on arrival

Image 2: Cardiac monitor tracing during the cardiac arrest 

Image 3: Coronary angiogram showing complete 
occlusion of LCX artery

Image 4: Coronary angiogram showing restoration of 
flow in the left circumflex artery
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